
Committee Secretary 

Senate Standing Committees on Community Affairs 

P.O. BOX 6100 

Parliament House 

Canberra ACT 2600 

          Monday 21st September, 2015  

Attention Committee Secretary, 

I am writing in regard to the No Jab No Pay legislation the government is currently considering. 

As the parent of a child who is now deceased because of his ‘immunisations’ I want you to know there are a growing number of 
parents now who are very concerned about this latest government’s attempts to coerce parents into a medical procedure they 
have investigated thoroughly and rejected. Yes, I am aware you would have been told vaccines are safe – well that is not true 
under any reasonable person’s definition – there is a product insert for each vaccine which has a long list of side effects and also 
the USA govt compensation fund has paid out approx 3.5 billion dollars in compensation for the damage done. The FDA in USA 
admits that only 10% of reactions are ever even reported. Safe according to the dictionary means “Free from harm”. My point is, 
that vaccinations cannot be described as safe and therefore any coercion by governments to force parents to subject their 
children to them needs to stop – vaccination needs be totally voluntary – without coercion or penalty. 

If the uneducated on this topic wish to go blindly and have their children have this medical procedure due to their fear and 
ignorance, then that is up to them. Parents making informed decisions to keep their children healthy without injections should 
have the same right.  

Personally I know hundreds of families making an informed decision regarding this medical procedure and they do so after many 
hours of research and at a cost to themselves. Parents I know who do vaccinate, as I did twice, do no homework whatsoever. I 
vaccinated out of fear. There are thankfully many researchers, scientists and doctors who have opened their minds to research 
independently of the drug company propaganda they learn in universities and they are seeing what is blatantly obvious – 
vaccines are not safe and they are definitely not effective. Most of the whooping cough in Australia right now is in the fully 
vaccinated according to Westmead Children’s Hospital Immunologists. 

 

When a tragedy like a child dying from whooping cough is all over the news media and the tragedy of a child dying from vaccines 
is ignored, people are asking why? Why is the government and media lying or covering up the damage done by vaccinations? 
The truth is starting to come out as social media gives grieving parents a voice. Go onto this site and see a very small amount of 
the damage done www.followingvaccinations.com and bear in mind this is just the tip of the iceberg as most parents have never 
even heard of this site to report their experience. 

The parents I have spoken to have stated they will leave the workforce if they do not have subsidised childcare –  less tax dollars 
in the government coffers will be the result, as well as a rising unemployment rate. These parents will attempt to get work 
around caring for their children, however, we know those jobs are few and far between, so they will be applying for 
unemployment benefits. They will not be having their children injected with formaldehyde, aluminium, mercury, preservatives, 
foreign proteins, toxoids etc. for money.  

 

Bottom line, no government should ever coerce or penalise parents for not subjecting their child to a medical treatment that can 
kill or injure them, and has never been scientifically proven to stop a person getting the disease. This manoeuvre by the 
government at the beckoning of vested interests will not get the desired result if that is a lift in vaccination rates. It is draconian 
and actually criminal that it is even being considered. 

Please confirm you have received this submission. 

Stephanie Bailey 
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