
CHL receives referrals, ensures 
documentation complete and 

registers. When vacancy arises, CHL 
will contact UCWPA to jointly select 

ERA tenant.  This may require 
seeking additional information from 
referral source regarding suitability 

and commitment to programme.

 UCWPA 
Transitional 

Support Officer 
contacts ERA 

candidate and 
assists with 
relocation 

requirements. 

CHL makes offer of property, and 
ensures that income/id up to date. 

CHL advises UCWPA 
of allocation date 
and rent and bond 

payable and 
arranges tenancy 
documentation.  

Advise UCWPA of 
allocation date. 

UCWPA & CHL attend allocation and 
sign up at the property

CHL allocates ERA property and 
provides info re rights/ 

responsibilities of each party, 
contact details, reporting 

maintenance, inspection regime and 
shows participant how to use 

appliances.  

UCWPA assists participant to set up 
CentrePay or other mechanisms for 

rent payment. 

CHL undertakes property and 
tenancy management including 
inspections, rent management, 

maintenance.

CHL maintains  contact with 
UCWPA and immediately advises 

of any property or tenancy 
management concerns. 

UCWPA establishes partnership 
model with key stakeholders 

assessed as having a relevant stake 
in assisting the individual/ family to 

progress their goals including 
identification of resources required 
and agreement between respective 

UCWPA establishes an agreed 
contact regime with stakeholders 

UCWPA maintains, monitors, and 
reviews the ongoing support plan 

with ERA participant/s and 
stakeholders. Involves establishing 
an agreed strength based approach 
to client servicing; identification of 
resources required; and agreement 

between respective partners 

CHL works with DCSI-Housing SA to 
facilitate access to alternative 

housing and in conjunction with 
UCWPA & assists participant/family 

to transition with appropriate 
services and supports (if required).

UCWPA & CHL undertakes 
appropriate referrals and if 

required, assist participant to 
transition out of program into 

alternative housing.   

Stakeholders (JSA’s, employers, 
schools, CHL) actively support 

work/training plan
Facilitates access to appropriate 
(pre) or employment / pathway 

activities  
Undertakes/implement agreed 

responsibilities
Maintains contact with support 

agency and intervene when 
required/requested

UCWPA establishes Service 
Agreement/Case Plan, privacy 

consent with individual/family:  

Relationship with participant/family 
established, formal engagement 
with co-service providers, map 

collaborative pathway and goals to 
enable coordinated response for 

ERA participation

CHL undertakes vacancy process and 
commences preparation for new 

participant as per Entry step.  

Entry and eligibility 
assessment by CHL 

OR UCWPA

Advise referring 
agency & applicant 

of assessment 
outcome

CHL and UCWPA

Operational Model ERA

Entry, Eligibility, Assessment

Housing Access and Support

Program Support (UCWPA)

Property Management (CHL)

Program Exit

UCWPA facilitates rent and bond 
assistance through DCSI-Housing SA 
supports CHL in allocation process. 

 


